From: Lisa Bonnett

To: Deb Brodie

Subject: FW- - Farmland Tax - Account #9215
Date: Wednesday, January 29, 2025 1:26:26 PM
Cheers,

‘Civa Bonnell

Tax/Utility Clerk

12435 Twp Rd 442

Box 358 | Sedgewick, AB | TOB 4CO
Direct: (780) 384-4132

Ibonnett@flagstaff.ab.ca
www.flagstaff.ab.ca

rrom: I

Sent: January 29, 2025 11:35 AM
To: Lisa Bonnett <lbonnett@flagstaff.ab.ca>
Subject: Re:- - Farmland Tax - Account #9215

Thank you for below info Lisa. Being an administrator would you be able to forward my
below request to the council for their kind consideration?

Again, any help you can offer is greatly appreciated.

Sent from my iPhone

OnJan 27, 2025, at 1:30 PM, Lisa Bonnett <lbonnett@flagstaff.ab.ca> wrote:

Hi-, unfortunately no matter how small the tax penalty amount,
administration is not able to cancel it.
Requests must go through Flagstaff County Council.

Cheers,

Cisaw Bevunell

Tax/Utility Clerk
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12435 Twp Rd 442

Box 358 | Sedgewick, AB | TOB 4C0O
Direct: (780) 384-4132
Ibonnett@flagstaff.ab.ca

www.flagstaff.ab.ca

From:_ <patty.wiedman@gmail.com>

Sent: January 24, 2025 3:11 PM
To: Lisa Bonnett <lbonnett@flagstaff.ab.ca>
Subject: Re: [l - Farmland Tax - Account #9215

Thank you for your speedy response Lisa. | guess | did not pay close enough
attention previously but | always remitted a payment in US funds after |
looked up the conversion rate to equal CAN funds billed - obviously
something went astray on my part, dang it!

Would you be able to provide consideration in removing the penalty of 12% &
the 6% to be assessed in May and I’ll cover the $16.10 shortage with the
2025 levy? | will remit an overage so | have a credit on account again. | know
it seems a trivial amount but | pride myself in not being charged penalties or
late fees even though as | stated above | fell down on the job here.

Sent from my iPhone





